
Vol. 189 • Issue 48 • Monday August 3, 2020

Published under Authority by the National Printing Corporation
Cnr. of Jeremie and Laborie Streets
Castries, Saint Lucia, West Indies

Tel.: (758) 468 2199
Fax : (758) 452 4582

Email : npc@gosl.gov.lc

Website Address : http://www.slugovprintery.com



153

SAINT LUCIA
PRINTED BY THE  NATIONAL PRINTING CORPORATION

CASTRIES
2020                                              [ Price : $3.00 ]

GOVERNMENT  NOTICE
_____________

    The following documents are published with and form part of this 
Extraordinary Gazette:

Assented Acts

Act No. 7 of 2020 — Gaming, Racing and Betting (Amendment) Act

Act No. 8 of 2020 — Styrofoam and Plastic Food Service Containers 
(Prohibition) (Amendment) Act



75

No. 7 ]      Gaming, Racing and Betting (Amendment) Act     [ 2020          

SAINT LUCIA
No. 7 of 2020

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS

Section

   1.   Short title
   2.   Amendment of section 22   



77

No. 7 ]      Gaming, Racing and Betting (Amendment) Act     [ 2020          

SAINT LUCIA
______________

No. 7 of 2020

AN ACT to amend the Gaming, Racing and Betting Act, Cap. 
13.13.

                                                                 [ 3rd August, 2020 ]

BE IT ENACTED by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the House of Assembly and the 
Senate of Saint Lucia, and by the authority of the same, as follows:

I Assent

NEVILLE CENAC,
Governor-General.

July 29, 2020.

[L.S.]



78

No. 7 ]        Gaming, Racing and Betting (Amendment) Act       [ 2020     

Short title

1. This Act may be cited as the Gaming, Racing and Betting 
(Amendment) Act, 2020.

Amendment of section 22

2. Section 22 of the Gaming, Racing and Betting Act, Cap. 13.13 
is amended —

 	 (a)	 by deleting subsection (12) and by substituting the 
following — 

	 “(12)  Notwithstanding subsection (11), Cabinet may grant
	   a gaming operator licence in respect of premises at which
	  gaming is to take place, which is not a hotel containing
	  two hundred and fifty rooms, if at least one hundred 
	  persons will be continuously employed at the premises.”;

	 (b)	 in subsection (13), by deleting the words “does not employ 
at least 200 persons” and by substituting the words “does 
not continuously employ at least one hundred persons”.

Passed in the House of Assembly this 21st day of July, 2020.

ANDY G. DANIEL,
Speaker of the House of Assembly.

Passed in the Senate this 23rd day of July, 2020.

JEANNINE GIRAUDY-MCINTYRE,
President of the Senate.

SAINT LUCIA
PRINTED BY THE  NATIONAL PRINTING CORPORATION

CASTRIES
                                                              2020                                      [ Price : $2.00 ]



79

No. 8 ]               Styrofoam and Plastic Food Service           [ 2020 
                  Containers (Prohibition) (Amendment) Act             

SAINT LUCIA
No. 8 of 2020

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS

Section

1.	 Short title
2.  Interpretation
3.	 Amendment of section 5
4.	 Amendment of section 6
5.	 Amendment of section 7

      



81

No. 8 ]               Styrofoam and Plastic Food Service           [ 2020 
                  Containers (Prohibition) (Amendment) Act             

  

                                

 SAINT LUCIA
__________

No. 8 of 2020

AN ACT to amend the Styrofoam and Plastic Food Service 
Containers (Prohibition) Act, No. 22 of 2019. 

                                                                 [ 3rd August, 2020 ]

BE IT ENACTED by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty, by 
and with the advice and consent of the House of Assembly and the 
Senate of Saint Lucia, and by the authority of the same, as follows:

I Assent

NEVILLE CENAC,
Governor-General.

July 29, 2020.

[L.S.]



82

No. 8 ]             Styrofoam and Plastic Food Service             [ 2020 
                Containers (Prohibition) (Amendment) Act                    

Short title

1. This Act may be cited as the Styrofoam and Plastic Food 
Service Containers (Prohibition) (Amendment) Act, 2020.

Interpretation

2. In this Act, “principal Act” means the  Styrofoam and 
Plastic Food Service Containers (Prohibition) Act, No. 22 of 2019.

Amendment of section 5

3. Section 5(1)(b) of the principal Act is amended by deleting the 
words “1st day of August, 2020” and by substituting the words “1st 
day of August, 2021”.

Amendment of section 6

4. Section 6(1) of the principal Act is amended —

	 (a)	 in paragraph (a), by deleting the words “1st day of August, 
2020” and by substituting the words “1st day of August, 
2021”;

	 (b)	 in paragraph (b), by deleting the words “1st day of August, 
2021” and by substituting the words “1st day of August, 
2022”.

Amendment of section 7

5. Section 7(1) of the principal Act is amended —

	 (a)	 in paragraph (a), by deleting the words “1st day of August, 
2020” and by substituting the words “1st day of August, 
2021”;

	 (b)	 in paragraph (b), by deleting the words “1st day of August, 
2021” and by substituting the words “1st day of August, 
2022”.



83

No. 8 ]               Styrofoam and Plastic Food Service           [ 2020 
                  Containers (Prohibition) (Amendment) Act             

Passed in the House of Assembly this 21st day of July, 2020.

ANDY G. DANIEL,
Speaker of the House of Assembly.

Passed in the Senate this 23rd day of July, 2020.

JEANNINE GIRAUDY-MCINTYRE,
President of the Senate.

SAINT LUCIA
PRINTED BY THE  NATIONAL PRINTING CORPORATION

CASTRIES
                                                              2020                                      [ Price : $2.50 ]


